FOI 2122042- Continuing Helathcare

Our request relates to retrospective claims pursued for NHS funded continuing
healthcare. These will include cases which are commonly referred to as PUPoC
(Previously Unassessed Periods of Care) and retrospective/ex gratia payment
cases. This will include cases registered with relevant PCT and then transferred
to the Clinical Commissioning Groups (CCGs) and include any figures in old
CCG areas.

The request is for information since 2012 or later if you do not hold information
from 2012.

In respect of the claims, please provide us with the following information:

1. How many retrospective cases have been completed by or on behalf of the
CCG

87 retrospective cases have been completed by the CCG.

2. How many of the cases referred to in 1 above have been successful (i.e
redress paid or waiting for redress to be paid)

44 of these cases have been successful.

3. Please provide the total amount paid in redress to claimants. Please
provide this amount annually.

2014/15 £55,160
2015/16 £285,497
2016/17 £165,768
2017/18 £51,058
2018/19 £14,711
2019/20 £3,284
2021/21 £0

4. In relation to 3 above, please provide the total amount paid in interest to
claimants. Please provide this information annually.

2019/20 Interest: £305.73
2020/21 Interest: £0

Calderdale CCG does not hold information in respect of the interest element paid
prior to 2019/20.



