
 
FOI 2122119- contracting 

NHS Calderdale CCG’s response to your request can be found below.   

1.  Does your CCG/ICS/CSU currently procure clinical decision support (CDS) or 
primary care support - Tools, Software or Services? 

o   If yes, are they any of the following: 
o   Ardens / Ardens for EMIS / QMasters 
o   Primary Care IT / Primary Care Pathways 
o   DXS Point-of-Care / CompleteCare 
o   Insight Solutions 
o   Clinical effectiveness group 
• Other - please specify 

 
NHS Calderdale CCG currently hold a contract with PA Consulting Services Limited for the 
Apex Insight Tool, and a contract with Ardens Health Informatics Limited for system 
support tools. 

2. What was the value for this procurement?  

The annual value of the Apex Insight Tool is £46,602 and the annual value for Ardens is 
£66,567. 

o Was this an OJEU/FTS process?  

 G-Cloud Services Framework was published as an OJEU contract notice, for 
both Ardens Health Informatics and PA Consulting Services Ltd. 

o Please detail the breakdown of the costs including CCG/CSU backfill for 
business change and project implementation costings.  

Calderdale CCG does not hold this information. 

 

3. Was this part of a funding exercise - if so please confirm details of the fund and its 
allocation. 

NHS Calderdale CCG received funding from the Digital First Primary Care funding stream 
for the Apex Insight Tool. 

 

4. What was the date of the contract inception?  

The contract with PA Consulting Services Limited started 1 September 2020 and the 
contract with Ardens Health Informatics Limited started on 1 April 2020. 

 

5. What other companies were reviewed as part of the tender process? Please provide 
any evidence of the review and scoring against your nominated criteria.  

The contract with PA Consulting Services Limited was called off from the National G-Cloud 
12 Framework Agreement. 

The contract with Ardens Health Informatics Limited was called off from the National G-
Cloud 12 Framework Agreement. 

 



6. Where was this tender presented to allow companies to apply?   

The tender was presented on Contracts Finder 
(https://www.contractsfinder.service.gov.uk/Notice/2cc07a58-348f-447a-913c-
e664fb99f8f2) and Ted Europa, reference RM1557.12. 

 

7. What is the current renewal date of the contract? 

The PA Consulting Services Limited expiry date is 1 September 2022 and the Ardens 
Health Informatics Limited is 1 April 2025. 

 

8. Please provide any copies of business cases that outline the requirement for this 
company and subsequent benefits realisation documentation post implementation 
detailing their requirements were met.  

Calderdale CCG does not hold this information. 
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