

[NHS Calderdale CCG's response can be found on the attached Excel spreadsheet.](#)

Where possible please kindly include responses on the attached Excel spreadsheet

1. Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the commissioner with responsibility for learning disabilities placements?

For questions 2 to 6, please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial years 2020/21 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2021/22.

2. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in residential care and supported living.

Of the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in residential care (q.2) please provide the number that are in 'in area' placements and the number that are in 'out of area' placements.

3. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in supported living.
4. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who transitioned from children's learning disabilities services into adult's services - in total, into adult residential care services only, and into adult supported living services only.
5. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who 'stepped down' from specialist inpatient hospital placements into adult residential care and supported living services.

6. Please provide the CCG's total expenditure on residential care and supported living for adults with learning disabilities for the financial year 2020/21, and budgeted expenditure for 2021/22.

7. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average weekly rate paid by the CCG for residential care placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2020/21 and 2021/22. If the CCG has weekly rate bands, please also provide these.

8. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average hourly rate paid by the CCG for supported living placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2020/21 and 2021/22. If the CCG has hourly rate bands, please also provide these.

9.

FOI Answers

CCG:	NHS Calderdale CCG
Date:	04/02/2021

1. Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the commissioner with responsibility for learning disabilities placements.	Name	Job title	Telephone No.	Email Address	Notes
	Sarah Antemes	Head of Continuing Health Care - Specialist Mental Health and Learning Disability Services	7795825086	sarah.antemes@nhs.net	

2. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in residential care and supported living.	2020/21	2021/22
Total in residential care	61	62

This excludes supported living as unfortunately the CCG does not hold this level of breakdown.

Of the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in residential care (q.2) please provide the number that are in 'in area' placements and the number that are in 'out of area' placements. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial year 2020/21 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2021/22.	2020/21	2021/22
In area		
Out of area	32	30

Please note, this includes nursing care as well as residential care

3. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the CCG in supported living. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial year 2020/21 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2021/22.	2020/21	2021/22
Total in supported living		

Unfortunately, the CCG does not hold this level of breakdown of care packages not 'categorised' as supported living but can include supported living components.

4. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who transitioned from children's learning disabilities services into adult's services - in total, into adult residential care services only, and into adult supported living services only. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial	2020/21	2021/22
---	---------	---------

year 2020/21 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2021/22.		
Total transitioned		
Transitioned to residential care		
Transitioned to supported living		

The CCG had no recent learning disability clients which transitioned from children's learning disability services in 2020/21 and 2021/22.

5. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who 'stepped down' from specialist inpatient hospital placements into adult residential care and supported living services. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial year 2020/21 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2021/22.	2020/21	2021/22
Stepped down into residential care		
Stepped down into supported living		

The CCG had less than 5 adults that stepped down in 2021/22 and no adults in 2020/21.

6. Please provide the CCG's total expenditure on residential care and supported living for adults with learning disabilities for the financial year 2020/21, and budgeted expenditure for 2021/22.	2020/21	2021/22
Total expenditure on residential care	£4,416,582	£4,741,907

Total expenditure on supported living		
---------------------------------------	--	--

Please note: this excludes supported living for the reason set out previously.

7. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average weekly rate paid by the CCG for residential care placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2020/21 and 2021/22. If the CCG has weekly rate bands, please also provide these.	2020/21	2021/22
Highest weekly rate, £	£3,942	£4,029
Lowest weekly rate, £	£111.79	£204
Average weekly rate, £	£1,089	£1,177
Weekly rate bands, £ (if used)		

This excludes supported living for the reason set out previously.

8. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average hourly rate paid by the CCG for supported living placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2020/21 and 2021/22. If the CCG has hourly rate bands, please also provide these.	2020/21	2021/22
Highest hourly rate, £		
Lowest hourly rate, £		
Average hourly rate, £		
Hourly rate bands, £ (if used)		

The CCG does not hold this information in the level of details requested.