FOI 2122168- Antidepressants
NHS Calderdale CCG’s (CCG) response to your request can be found below.

1. The figures for the numbers that have been prescribed antidepressants
(SSRI's) over the last five years.

Prescribing data is publicly available via https://opendata.nhsbsa.net/

2. The figures for the proportions of demographic (age/ethnic group etc.) groups
prescribed antidepressants.

The CCG does not hold this information

3. The figures for the proportion who continued/discontinued taking
antidepressants pre/post-lockdown(s) for the following date:

239 March 2020 - August 2020
31st October 2020 - 2" December 2020
6" January 2021- 29" March 2021

The CCG does not hold this information

5. The data on the reasons individuals have given from 2020-2021 for
requesting antidepressants.

The CCG does not hold this information
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