
FOI 2122197- Cataract contracts 
 
NHS Calderdale CCG’s (CCG) response to your request can be found below. 
 
 

1. Please provide the name of all commissioned providers for Cataract surgery 
within the CCG/ICS. 
 
The CCG commissions Cataract Surgery across Calderdale and Huddersfield 
Foundation Trusts, Mid Yorkshire Hospitals Trust, Leeds Teaching Hospitals, 
Bradford Teaching Hospitals Foundation Trust, SpaMedica, The Yorkshire 
Clinic, East Lancashire Hospitals NHS Trust and Pennine Acute Hospitals 
Trust. 
 
 

2. Please provide the name of all providers offering Cataract surgery within your 
CCG/ICS who are delivering through non-contracted activity. 
 
New Medica, Optegra, Community Health and Eyecare, BMI (Highfield 
Hospital and Gisburne Park Hospital), Practice Plus Group, Manchester 
University NHS Foundation Trust, York and Scarborough Teaching Hospitals 
NHS Foundation Trust, Cambridge University Hospitals NHS Foundation 
Trust, Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust, East Cheshire 
NHS Trust and Moorfields Eye Hospital NHS Foundation Trust are offering 
Cataract Surgery via non-contracted activity. 
 
 

3. Please provide details of the referral pathway (by CCG/ICS) for patients who 
are being referred for Cataract surgery. Please state if referrals are made to a 
provider directly, via the patients GP or other route of referral. (if other, please 
provide details). 
 
The CCG has commissioned a pre-operative cataract scheme, optometrists 
are expected to offer choice and refer direct to the provider. 
 
Occasionally GPs make direct referrals on Electronic Eyecare Referral 
System (EERS). Please see attached the referral pathway.  
 
 

4. Please confirm if your CCG/ICS have commissioned/are using an Electronic 
Eyecare Referral System. If so, please confirm then name of the provider and 
date it is due to start. 
 



Our local provider (Calderdale and Huddersfield Foundation Trusts) is piloting 
the EERS. For details defer to provider. 
 
 

5. For the providers detailed in your response to questions 1 and 2. Please 
provide the total number of completed Cataract surgery for the periods 
2020/21 and 2021/22 (to date) for your CCG/ICS. 
 
Please see below for the number of Cataract surgeries for Calderdale CCG 
20/21 and 21/22 YTD (Apr-21 to Feb-22). 
 
 

Calderdale 
CCG    

Year 
  

ProviderCode ProviderName 2021 2122 
ACG40 NEWMEDICA - WAKEFIELD 0 * 
NNH02 OPTEGRA YORKSHIRE EYE HOSPITAL 145 65 
NNH04 OPTEGRA (MANCHESTER EYE HOSPITAL) * * 
NPG01 SPAMEDICA MANCHESTER * * 
NPG07 SPAMEDICA EYE HOSPITAL (WAKEFIELD) 245 165 
NPG08 SPAMEDICA BOLTON * * 
NPG10 SPAMEDICA SHEFFIELD 10 15 
NPG12 SPAMEDICA ECCLESHILL TREATMENT CENTRE 625 1,395 
NPG17 SPAMEDICA PRESTON 0 * 
NT420 BMI - THE HIGHFIELD HOSPITAL 0 * 
NT497 BMI GISBURNE PARK HOSPITAL * 0 
NTPAE PRACTICE PLUS GROUP OPHTHALMOLOGY - NORTH WEST * 10 

 

Calderdale 
CCG    

Year 
  

NVC20 THE YORKSHIRE CLINIC 35 25 
R0A MANCHESTER UNIVERSITY NHS FOUNDATION TRUST * * 
RAE BRADFORD TEACHING HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION TRUST * * 

RCB 
YORK AND SCARBOROUGH TEACHING HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION 
TRUST * 0 

RGT CAMBRIDGE UNIVERSITY HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION TRUST 0 * 
RHQ SHEFFIELD TEACHING HOSPITALS NHS FOUNDATION TRUST * 0 
RJN EAST CHESHIRE NHS TRUST * 0 
RP6 MOORFIELDS EYE HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST 0 * 
RR8 LEEDS TEACHING HOSPITALS NHS TRUST * * 
RW6 PENNINE ACUTE HOSPITALS NHS TRUST 0 * 
RWY CALDERDALE AND HUDDERSFIELD NHS FOUNDATION TRUST 305 680 
RXR EAST LANCASHIRE HOSPITALS NHS TRUST * * 
  Total 1,400 2,395 

 



*  indicates no activity submissions with the provider for that year, 0 indicates 
activity submitted but 0 value 
 

6. Please provide the total number of patients waiting for Cataract surgery within 
your CCG/ICS. 
 
NHS Calderdale CCG do not hold this information, defer to the providers 
listed in Q2. 
 

7. Please provide the total number of patients waiting 52+ weeks for Cataract 
surgery within your CCG/ICS and of those how many have been waiting 104+ 
weeks. 
 
NHS Calderdale CCG do not hold this information, defer to the providers 
listed in Q2. 
 

8. Please confirm when your current contract that includes Cataract surgery is 
due to expire and if there is an option to extend services. If there is an option 
to extend, please advise on how long for. 
 
Contracts for Cataract Surgery have an expiry date of March 2023 and do not 
have an option to extend the service. 
 

9. Please confirm the name and contact details of the individual(s) who manage 
this contract within the CCG/ICS. 
 
Serena Meakin – Serena.meakin@nhs.net  
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